
NO Registration required UNLESS noted .  Questions? Please call 610-353-1022. 

Family Programs 

Story Times 
 

Bookin’ with Babies 

Wednesdays @ 10 am 

11/2—12/21 

For ages birth  to 2. Join your 
little one for stories, music & 
movement, followed by play 
time with the library’s toys.  

Miss Theresa comes 11/30– 
12/21. 

 

Toddle on Over 

Tuesdays @ 10 am 

11/1—12/6 

For ages 2 & 3. A lively pro-
gram featuring books, music & 
movement, followed by  
a simple craft.  

NO story time on 11/8. 

 

Programs for 
birth to Preschool 
 

Music, Art & Me 

Thursday, 12/1 @ 10 am 

For ages 2-6. An interactive 

music program followed by a 

simple art project. 
 

 

Music with Mr. Tom 

Tuesday, 12/13 @ 10  am 

For all ages.  A fun, interactive 
program led by children’s musi-
cian Tom Pickard. 
 

Mommy & Me Yoga 

Mondays @ 10:30 am 

11/7, 21 & 28, 12/5 & 19 

For ages birth to 2. Join teacher 
Molly Geocke for a fun practice 
including yoga songs & partner 
poses with your little one! Bring 
your own mat or use on of ours.  

 

Dance Me a Story! 

11/18 & 12/12 

From 10:15 to 11 am 

For ages 2 to 5. Join dance 
teacher Lisa Oster in this  

popular class where partici-
pants act out a story using differ-
ent styles of dance and 
music. 

 

Programs for all 

ages 
Pop’s Cookie Duster 

Saturday, 11/12   

@ 10:30 am 

Don & Lee Doyle will read their 
wonderful book, Pop's Cookie 
Duster ! 

Newtown Public Library 

November 
December 2016 

The Man-Eating  Balloon 

Show!  

Tuesday, 12/27 @ 1 pm 

A comical magic show for the 

whole family!  

 

Ring in the New Year Party! 
Thursday, 12/29 @ 11 am 

Ring in the New Year early with 

music, food, games & count-

down at noon! 

 

  

Programs for  

ages 5+ 

STEM Marconi Challenge 

Saturday, 12/12 from 1 to 4 p 

For ages 10 to 14. PLEASE  

REGISTER  by phone or online. 

Presented by Dr. Dennis Silage 
of the Temple University. The 
Marconi Challenge uses infra-
red data transmission (like in 
your TV remote control) to com-
plete cool activities!   

 

 

 

 

 

201  Bishop Hollow Rd., Newtown Square, PA 


